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ORIGINAL ARTICLE
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PREGNANT WOMEN ATTENDING 

ANTENATAL CARE UNIT AT BOLAN 
MEDICAL COLLEGE HOSPITAL  

QUETTA, PAKISTAN
Ghazala Noor1, Inamullah Kakar 

INTRODUCTION
	 Hepatitis C Virus is major public 
health problem worldwide as well 
as in Pakistan. Hepatitis C Virus was 
first identified in 1989, Infection with 
this virus is a major cause of chronic 
hepatitis cirrhosis and hepatocellular 
carcinoma around the world1 Hepa-
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titis C virus is a single stranded virus 
in the flaviviridae family2 Chronic 
infection with hepatitis C has become 
a world wide health problem, Anti 
HCV antibodies are detected in 1-2% 
of people residing in Europe, USA, 
Taiwan and Australia. Its frequency is 
higher in North Africa, where it fluc-
tuates between 15 and 17%3. There 

are estimated 300, million carriers of 
the virus all over the world4. 
	 The world wide prevalence of hep-
atitis C infection in pregnant women 
estimated to be between 1 and 8% 
and in children between 0.05 and 
5%5 Hepatitis C virus is one of the 
major etiological agents of parentally 
acquired hepatitis.
	 HCV infection is asymptomatic in 
a large proportion of cases (65-75%) 
and revealed only accidentally by ab-
normal liver function test and/or anti 
HCV positivity. Approximately 7-8% 
of hepatitis C virus positive women 
transmit this virus to their off springs 
(vertical transmission)6-7. In Pakistan 
10 million people are presumed to 
be infected with HCV8, little is known 
about hepatitis C Virus infection in 
pregnant women in India, the sero-
prevalence of Anti HCV antibody in 
the healthy general population of 
India was found to be 1.5% each in 
234 voluntary blood donors and 65 
pregnant women6. 
	 In Pakistan few studies have been 
done on pregnant population like in 
Swat where the prevalence of anti 
HCV in pregnant women was 2.52%9 
& in Karachi it was 5.79%10. In Nawab-
shah prevalence was 3.44% and out 
of 102 women positive for HCV an-
tibodies 9.8% had delivery, 18.62% 
had previous surgery, 19.60% had 
blood transfusion and 5.86% received 
injections7. In Multan prevalence of 
anti HCV was 7%, among 35 anti HCV 
positive women 57.14% had history of 
previous surgery, 37.14% had history 
of multiple injections and 14.28% 
received blood transfusion11.
	 Pregnant women use more health 
care and are expected to be the major 
victim of HCV infection because of 
greater exposure to syringes, minor 
& major surgeries, blood & blood 
products especially during pregnancy 
& delivery.
	 Although local studies are available 
on this subject but were done on a 
small sample size. And few studies 
were done on retrospective data and 
as quality of data is not as good as 
collected properly. Therefore based 
on these studies, result cannot be 
generalized. Therefore the present 
study is designed with the larger 
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DISCUSSION
	 Worldwide viral hepatitis is the 
commonest cause of hepatic dysfunc-
tion in pregnancy. Pakistan is highly 

sample size so that actual burden of 
HCV and factors leading to it could 
be assessed. Furthermore strategies 
could be made to screen all women 
for HCV & factors leading to it. There 
by promoted treatment could lead 
to decrease the morbidity. This study 
was conducted to determine frequen-
cy of Hepatitis C among pregnant 
women attending antenatal care unit 
at BMCH Quetta.

MATERIAL & METHODS
	 This cross-sectional study was con-
ducted over a period of six months(-
from 9th August 2013 to 9th February 
2014) at the Department of Obstetrics 
& Gynaecology, Bolan Medical Com-
plex Hospital, Quetta.595 pregnant 
women were required for estimated 
prevalence of Hepatitis C of 2.52%9 
with 95% confidence level and esti-
mated margin of error 1.26%.
	 All Antenatal women aged be-
tween 20 to 35 with any period of 
gestation, both primi and multi 
gravida, attending antenatal care 
unit at BMCH Quetta and willing to 
participate were included in the study. 
Patient who were already diagnosed 
as a case of any type of hepatitis were 
excluded from the study. Non-proba-
bility consecutive sampling technique 
was used to get the required sample 
size.
	 Eligible antenatal women coming 
to antenatal clinic or directly to labour 
room at BMCH Quetta were enrolled 
in the study. Informed consent was 
taken for inclusion in the study after 
explaining the purpose, procedure, 
risk and benefit of the study. All the 
patients were advised to have anti 
HCV antibodies by ELISA 3 (Enzyme 
Linked Immune Sorbant Assay). The 
diagnostic criteria was positive anti 
HCV anti bodies by ELISA 3. In positive 
anti HCV anti body patient, a detailed 
history was taken with special refer-
ence to search fro presence of risk 
factors i.e. (blood transfusions, place 
of previous delivery, previous surgery, 
use of I/V medicines) and any family 
member with positive anti HCV posi-
tive antibody. The test was performed 
by a single nominated lab (BMCH 
main pathology Lab) by single pathol-
ogist heaving more than five year of 
experience. All the variables like, age, 

HCV positive /negative status, family 
history and risk factors were entered 
in the proforma attached.
	 The data was entered and analyzed 
through SPSS version 19.0. Mean 
and standard deviation was calcu-
lated for quantitative variable like 
age of the women and gestational 
age. Frequency and percentage was 
calculated for categorical/qualitative 
variable like Hepatic C (+/-) status, 
previous history of blood transfusion 
and risk factors (previous surgery, and 
IV Medicine. The result was presented 
in the form of tables. 

RESULTS
	 The mean age of the patients was 
26.1±4.5 years. The mean gestation-
al age of the patients was 28.3±7.3 
weeks. There were 119 (20.0%) pa-
tients in the gestational age range 
of 15-20 weeks, 128 (21.5%) patients 
in the gestational age range of 21-
25 weeks, 84 (14.1%) patients in the 
gestational age of 26-30 weeks, 134 
(22.5%) patients in the gestational 
age range of 31-35 weeks and 130 
(21.9%) patients in the gestational 
age range of 36-40 weeks 

TABLE 1: ELISA RESULTS OF STUDY PARTICIPANTS (n=595)

Anti-HCV No. of patients Percentage
Positive 41 6.9%
Negative 554 93.1%
Total 595 100.0

TABLE 2: EXPOSURE HISTORY OF HCV+ PATIENTS

Previous history of blood transfusion No. of patients Percentage
Yes 3 7.3%
No 38 92.7%
Total 41 100.0
Previous surgery
Yes 4 9.8%
No 37 90.2%
Total 41 100.0
IV medicine used
Yes 3 7.3%
No 38 92.7%
Total 41 100.0
HCV+  child
Yes 2 4.9%
No 39 95.1%
Total 41 100.0
HCV+  family member
Yes 3 7.3%
No 38 92.7%
Total 41 100.0

endemic for hepatitis B & C12,13. In 
our study the frequency of HCV was 
6.9% while prevalence of HCV in de-
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the history of previous surgery, blood 
transfusions, history of injections as 
risk factors.
	 A study from India in 2007 showed 
that a substantial proportion 62% of 
women with HCV had no evidence of 
exposure to any known risk factors29. 
This is in accordance with the results 
of our study. 
	 Universal HCV screening in preg-
nancy is considered to be unjustified 
given the absence of an intervention 
to prevent mother to child transmis-
sion.30 In developing countries be-
cause of poverty and lack of facilities, 
women have poor access to the hos-
pitals, so screening for HCV should 
be carried out during antenatal visits 
as this might be their only interaction 
to a health care facility. 
	 In our study the mean age of 
the patients was 26.1±4.5 years. As 
compared with the study of Ishaq et 
al31 the mean age of the patients was 
30.37 years, which is comparable with 
our study.
	 In our study the frequency of hep-
atitis C was found in 6.9% patients. As 
compared with the study of Ishaq et 
al31 the frequency of hepatitis C was 
found in 5% patients, which is compa-
rable with our study. In another study 
conducted by Shaikh et al7 hepatitis C 
was found positive in 3.44% patients, 
which is also comparable with our 
study.
	 In our study the history of blood 
transfusion as a factor leading to hep-
atitis C was found in 7.3% patients. As 
compared with the study of Ishaq et 
al149 the history of blood transfusion 
was found in 6.25% patients, which 
is comparable with our study. In 
another study conducted by Shaikh 
et al7 blood transfusion was found in 
19.60% patients. 
	 In our study the history of previous 
surgery as a factor leading to hepa-
titis C was found in 9.8% patients. As 
compared with the study of Ishaq et 
al149 the history of previous surgery 
was found in 10.93% patients, which 
is comparable with our study.
	 In our study the history of intra-
venous medicine used as a factor 
leading to hepatitis C was found in 
7.3% patients. As compared with the 

study of Ishaq et al149 the history of 
previous surgery was found in 9.37% 
patients, which is comparable with 
our study.
	 It is concluded from the above 
discussion that HCV is a common 
infection in pregnant women. Risk 
factors include contaminated surgical 
instruments, use of contaminated 
syringes, and blood products. 

CONCLUSION
	 It is concluded from this study that 
HCV is common infection in pregnant 
women. There was a high frequency 
of HCV sero positivity among preg-
nant women in this study. Risk factors 
include blood transfusion, previous 
surgery and history of IV medicine 
used leads to transmission of infec-
tion. Spread by these routes may be 
minimized by a protocol followed 
regarding strict screening, and aware-
ness regarding Hepatitis C should be 
promoted among health workers and 
general public.
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